From: Cathy Wiles
To: "Kathy Bartlett"; Deardoff. Amy
Cc: moocom@aol.com
Subject: RE: 4957-WR-3 Application PN
Date: Friday, August 10, 2018 2:09:32 PM
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Yes, this has been taken care of, the notice is running on Monday 8/13.
Thank you

Cathy Wiles
' Classified Sales Manager | cwiles@nwadg.com
479-571-6421 | G

Northwest Arkansas Democrat-Gazette www.nwadg.com
Our community. Our paper.

212 N. East Ave. Fayetteville, AR 72701

From: Kathy Bartlett [mailto:kathy@aquatechsys.com]
Sent: Friday, August 10, 2018 12:31 PM

To: 'Deardoff, Amy'; 'Cathy Wiles'

Cc: moocom@aol.com

Subject: RE: 4957-WR-3 Application PN

| spoke to Merideth last night She said she would be calling you today with a credit card #

Thanks

Katuryn Bartlett

Internal Operations Manager
NWA Utility Services, Inc

Www.nwautilityservices.com
Direct: 479-530-5926

From: Deardoff, Amy [mailto:DEARDOFF@adeq.state.ar.us]
Sent: Friday, August 10, 2018 9:08 AM

To: 'Cathy Wiles'
Cc: 'moocom@aol.com’; 'Kathy Bartlett'
Subject: RE: 4957-WR-3 Application PN

Thanks, Cathy! ©
Amy Deardoff

P: 501-682-0650
F: 501-682-0880
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From: Cathy Wiles [mailto:cwiles@nwadg.com]
Sent: Friday, August 10, 2018 9:16 AM

To: Deardoff, Amy
Subject: RE: 4957-WR-3 Application PN

Amy, just an FYI, | had to move this to Monday date 8/13. Had not received payment by deadline for
the Sat. issue. Sheis to call me today with payment.

Thanks

Cathy

Cathy Wiles
. Classified Sales Manager | cwiles@nwadg.com
479-571-6421 |

Northwest Arkansas Democrat-Gazette www.nwadg.com
Our community. Our paper.

212 N. East Ave. Fayetteville, AR 72701

From: Deardoff, Amy [mailto:DEARDOFF@adeq.state.ar.us]
Sent: Wednesday, August 08, 2018 8:44 AM

To: legalads@nwadg.com

Cc: Byrne, Timothy; Solaimanian, Jamal
Subject: 4957-WR-3 Application PN

Please run the attached ad in the Northwest Arkansas Democrat Gazette for one day as soon
as possible. The ad is attached in both RTF and PDF for your convenience.

Please reply with an email stating the publication date.
Please do not invoice this agency. Billing information is below.

Meredith Chisolm

Joyce Street Cottages
4193 Rolling Meadows Dr.
Fayetteville, AR 72703
479-409-4767

moocom@aol.com

If Ms. Chisolm has any questions about the ad, please have her contact Timothy Byrne at

501-682-0648 or by email at byrnet@adeq.state.ar.us.

Amy Deardoff
P: 501-682-0650
F: 501-682-0880
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From: Cathy Wiles

To: Deardoff, Am

Subject: RE: ADEQ

Date: Friday, August 10, 2018 1:44:44 PM
Yes ma'am

----- Original Message-----

From: Deardoff, Amy [mailto:DEARDOFF@adeqg.state.ar.us]
Sent: Friday, August 10, 2018 1:37 PM

To: 'Cathy Wiles'

Subject: RE: ADEQ

Just to confirm, the ad is actually going to run on 8/13/18, correct?

Amy Deardoff
P: 501-682-0650
F: 501-682-0880

————— Original Message-----

From: Cathy Wiles [mailto:cwiles@nwadg.com]
Sent: Friday, August 10, 2018 1:45 PM

To: 'Meredith Chisholm'

Cc: Deardoff, Amy

Subject: RE: ADEQ

Attached is your receipt of payment, the affidavit will be sent out next
week.

Thank you

Cathy

----- Original Message-----

From: Meredith Chisholm [mailto:moocom@aol.com]
Sent: Thursday, August 09, 2018 6:58 PM

To: cwiles@nwadg.com
Subject: ADEQ

I will call you first thing in the am with payment info for the ad which
will run on 8/11. Thanks, Meredith Chisholm

Sent from my iPhone
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